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MELBOURNE RANKED NUMBER 1
CITY FOR STUDENTS IN AUSTRALIA

IMPORTANT DATES
FOR YOUR DIARY

05th Excursion Day
13th Orientation
for September
intake
15th September
intake CoE start
date
15th Monthly tuition
fees due date

September

A GOOD READ...

By: Roopsirat K
Sekhon
Campus
Manager

Ranked 1 in Australia for “Best
Student City”
Ranked 3 in the world for “Student
Voice
Ranked 5 in the world for “Best
Student City”

Melbourne ranked number 1 city for
students in Australia and climbed
another position to rank 5th in the
world following the release of QS best
student city rankings 2023.
In “The QS Best Student Cities Ranking
2023” Melbourne moves one rank up
beating Sydney, Brisbane, and
Adelaide. Placing Melbourne at

Currently, more than 85,000
international students reside in
Melbourne, and the biggest cohort of
these international students are from
India, making up 22% of all
international students followed by
Nepal, Vietnam, and China. Studying as
an international student is a privilege 

but there are a set of challenges such
as language barrier, homesickness,
financial difficulties, and cultural shock.
Moreover, to deal with such situations
all they need is ears who can listen to
their problems. Following the same,
ASLI always encourages all staff to
focus on student support. The first
week of August 2022, some of our staff
& students had morning tea to know
more about their experiences in
Australia. ASLI staff is always available
to provide any kind of support to
international students if required.
Building such strong connections with
our students will not only increase their
involvement but also improve their
academic performance and promote
lifelong learning at ASLI.

We here at ASLI will continue to
support our students when required.
For any support or questions please
contact us at sso@asli.vic.edu.au
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